
        THE DAILY PROPHET NEWSPAPER 
 
Breaking news, at approximately 3:30pm today Lord 
Voldemort ( otherwise known as Tom Riddle ) was 
arrested on suspicion of opening the Chamber Of Secrets.  
 
A staff member named Hagrid was the one that had seen 
Riddle next to the door and caught him while it was wide 
open. He was peering inside to see if anything suspicious 
was hiding in there as there was a rumor for periods of 
time ( over 50 years ago ) when something dreadful and 
appalling had happened. The Chamber Of Secrets was 
opened and to this day it has surprisingly re-opened. We 
hear now from a student from the school of witchcraft and 
wizardry, Harry Potter.  
 
“I think it is shocking that  innocent people are being 
accused for opening the Chamber when it was really 
Voldemort. Disbelief silenced the air when all of the pupils 
at Hogwarts heard about the Chamber Of Secrets and 
now that it has been defeated because of Tom Riddle 
opening  it and now everyone does not have to panic nor 
worry anymore about the chamber, which is a good sign 
for myself, as suspicion and mystery is key to me as I 
ponder an awful lot of the time.”  

 



We also hear from Hagrid - one of Harry’s good friends - 
who said that he was the one that witnessed Lord 
Voldemort and that he was the one who reported it straight 
away to all of the members of staff, which of those that 
include: Professor Dumbledore, Professor Snape, 
Professor McGonagall and Gilderoy Lockhart. This is very 
peculiar as Hagrid was actually one of the targeted 
suspects that most people thought was guilty himself of 
the said offence.  
This is what he declared. “Now, I saw Voldemort opening 
the chamber peering in seeking for gold, diamonds and 
expensive jewellery. He hadn't been having the greatest 
success so without hesitancy, he crept inside. This was 
where I saw him!!! It was very late at night and I was just 
walking back to my Gryffindor common room but when I 
saw Riddle I changed direction immediately and alerted 
the staff and teachers almost in a flash. Voldemort was 
caught red-handed!”  
 
Anyway, that is the actual reality of how Tom Riddle was 
caught and how he was suspended from all duties and 
how he was taken to prison for almost the rest of his life 
and will indeed be extremely fortunate if he were to be 
released. 
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